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Cisco authorized self-study book for CCSP VPN foundation learning

Evaluate the features, functions, and benefits of Cisco VPN products●

Understand the component technologies that are implemented in Cisco VPN products●

Learn the procedures, steps, and commands required to configure and test IPSec in Cisco IOS Software and●

the Cisco PIX Firewall
Install and configure the Cisco VPN client to create a secure tunnel to a Cisco VPN Concentrator and Cisco●

PIX Firewall
Configure and verify IPSec in the Cisco VPN Concentrator, Cisco router, and Cisco PIX Firewall●

Enable interoperability among the Cisco VPN Concentrator, Cisco routers, and Cisco PIX Firewalls●

Apply scalability and advanced configuration features supported in the Cisco IPSec implementation●

With the recent availability of high-speed Internet connections to the home and the continued move of
workers out of central office locations (whether for travel, telecommuting, or branch office expansion),
virtual private networks (VPNs) have become a critical part of corporate network architectures. VPNs use
advanced encryption and tunneling to permit your organization to establish secure, end-to-end, private
network connections over third-party networks, such as the Internet. This new networking paradigm not only
adds to the efficiency of the corporate workforce, but it also saves money by leveraging third-party networks
and allows you to scale your networks with greater ease.

Cisco Secure Virtual Private Networks is a Cisco authorized self-paced learning tool. It is a comprehensive,
results-oriented book designed to give you the knowledge you need to plan, deploy, and manage VPNs in
your network environment. Beginning with an overview of VPNs and IPSec, the book introduces you to the
Cisco(r) VPN family of products. It then delves into the details of configuring and troubleshooting IPSec
site-to-site VPNs on Cisco IOS(r) routers and Cisco PIX(r) Firewalls using preshared keys and digital
certificates. You learn how to install the VPN 3000 Concentrator and how to configure it for remote access
using preshared keys and digital certificates. Monitoring and administration techniques are also presented.
The book concludes with a discussion on the scalability solutions available for IPSec VPNs. Each chapter
includes an explicit set of learning objectives and concludes with a set of review questions to assess your
understanding of the material. Numerous examples are provided throughout, and detailed diagrams help
clarify concepts presented in the text.

Cisco Secure Virtual Private Networks provides you with a complete solution for designing, implementing,
and managing Cisco VPN networks, helping you make the most efficient use of your VPN solution.

Cisco Secure Virtual Private Networks is part of a recommended study program from Cisco Systems(r) that
includes simulation and hands-on training from authorized Cisco Learning Partners and self-study products
from Cisco Press. To find out more about instructor-led, e-learning, and hands-on instruction offered by
authorized Cisco Learning Partners worldwide, please visit www.cisco.com/go/authorizedtraining.

This volume is in the Certification Self-Study Series offered by Cisco Press(r). Books in this series provide
officially developed training solutions to help networking professionals understand technology
implementations and prepare for the Cisco Career Certifications examinations.
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From reader reviews:

Cesar Smith:

This book untitled Cisco Secure Virtual Private Networks to be one of several books this best seller in this
year, that is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this
kind of book in the book retail outlet or you can order it via online. The publisher with this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you easier to read this book, since you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So
there is no reason for your requirements to past this publication from your list.

Jarred Chisolm:

Typically the book Cisco Secure Virtual Private Networks will bring someone to the new experience of
reading a book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book you
just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book Cisco Secure Virtual Private Networks is much
recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can easier to read
the book.

Clarine Davidson:

Beside this kind of Cisco Secure Virtual Private Networks in your phone, it may give you a way to get nearer
to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh in the oven so
don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Cisco Secure
Virtual Private Networks because this book offers to you readable information. Do you at times have book
but you don't get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this with your
hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still
want to miss this? Find this book as well as read it from at this point!

Lyle Morales:

You will get this Cisco Secure Virtual Private Networks by visit the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing
or reviewing it might to be your solve issue if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve
are various. Not only simply by written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book simply by e-book.
In the modern era similar to now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what their
problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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