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This textbook originates from a lecture course in laser physics at the Karlsruhe School of Optics and
Photonics at the Karlsruhe Institute of Technology (KIT). A main goal in the conception of this textbook was
to describe the fundamentals of lasers in a uniform and especially lab-oriented notation and formulation as
well as many currently well-known laser types, becoming more and more important in the future. It closes a
gap between the measureable spectroscopic quantities and the whole theoretical description and modeling.
This textbook contains not only the fundamentals and the context of laser physics in a mathematical and
methodical approach important for university-level studies. It allows simultaneously, owing to its conception
and its modern notation, to directly implement and use the learned matter in the practical lab work. It is
presented in a format suitable for everybody who wants not only to understand the fundamentals of lasers but
also use modern lasers or even develop and make laser setups. This book tries to limit prerequisite
knowledge and fundamental understanding to a minimum and is intended for students in physics, chemistry
and mathematics after a bachelor degree, with the intention to create as much joy and interest as seen among
the participants of the corresponding lectures.

This university textbook describes in its first three chapters the fundamentals of lasers: light-matter
interaction, the amplifying laser medium and the laser resonator. In the fourth chapter, pulse generation and
related techniques are presented. The fifth chapter gives a closing overview on different laser types gaining
importance currently and in the future. It also contains a set of examples on which the theory learned in the
first four chapters is applied and extended.
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From reader reviews:

Teresa Brown:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. Yes, by
reading a reserve your ability to survive increase then having chance to stay than other is high. For you who
want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of Laser Physics: From Principles to Practical
Work in the Lab (Graduate Texts in Physics) book as starter and daily reading guide. Why, because this book
is usually more than just a book.

Dexter Forsyth:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all this time you only find reserve that
need more time to be study. Laser Physics: From Principles to Practical Work in the Lab (Graduate Texts in
Physics) can be your answer mainly because it can be read by an individual who have those short time
problems.

Donna Solano:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Laser Physics: From Principles to
Practical Work in the Lab (Graduate Texts in Physics) can be the reply, oh how comes? It's a book you
know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this brand-new era is common
not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Ryan Barrett:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This book Laser Physics: From Principles to Practical Work in the Lab (Graduate Texts
in Physics) was filled regarding science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your technology
competence. Some people has several feel when they reading a book. If you know how big selling point of a
book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that
you wanted.
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