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The volume is dedicated to Boris Mirkin on the occasion of his 70th birthday. In addition to his startling PhD
results in abstract automata theory, Mirkin’s ground breaking contributions in various fields of decision
making and data analysis have marked the fourth quarter of the 20th century and beyond. Mirkin has done
pioneering work in group choice, clustering, data mining and knowledge discovery aimed at finding and
describing non-trivial or hidden structures—first of all, clusters, orderings and hierarchies—in multivariate
and/or network data.

This volume contains a collection of papers reflecting recent developments rooted in Mirkin’s fundamental
contribution to the state-of-the-art in group choice, ordering, clustering, data mining and knowledge
discovery. Researchers, students and software engineers will benefit from new knowledge discovery
techniques and application directions.
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From reader reviews:

James Barclay:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Clusters, Orders, and Trees: Methods and Applications: In Honor of
Boris Mirkin's 70th Birthday (Springer Optimization and Its Applications). Try to face the book Clusters,
Orders, and Trees: Methods and Applications: In Honor of Boris Mirkin's 70th Birthday (Springer
Optimization and Its Applications) as your good friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you
truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your
case. The book makes you more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we
need to make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Jason Young:

The book Clusters, Orders, and Trees: Methods and Applications: In Honor of Boris Mirkin's 70th Birthday
(Springer Optimization and Its Applications) has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you read this book you
can get a lot of help. The book was published by the very famous author. Tom makes some research before
write this book. This book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this book.

Nancy Steffen:

Exactly why? Because this Clusters, Orders, and Trees: Methods and Applications: In Honor of Boris
Mirkin's 70th Birthday (Springer Optimization and Its Applications) is an unordinary book that the inside of
the publication waiting for you to snap that but latter it will surprise you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such incredible way makes the
content inside easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is
good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give
you a lot of advantages than the other book have such as help improving your ability and your critical
thinking method. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the e-book store
hurriedly.

Glenn Connelly:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than
can satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find reserve that need more time to be
examine. Clusters, Orders, and Trees: Methods and Applications: In Honor of Boris Mirkin's 70th Birthday
(Springer Optimization and Its Applications) can be your answer mainly because it can be read by you who
have those short time problems.
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