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The Broadview Anthology of Victorian Poetry and Poetic Theory is the most comprehensive collection of
poetry from the period ever published. Included are generous selections from the work of all major poets,
and a representation of the work of virtually every poet of significance, from Thomas Ashe at the beginning
of the era to Charlotte Mew at its end. The work of Victorian women poets features very prominently, with
extensive selections not only from canonical poets such as Elizabeth Barrett Browning and Christina
Rossetti, but also from poets such as Augusta Webster for which high claims have recently been made by
critics. The anthology reflects (and will contribute to) the ongoing reassessment of the canon that is central to
English Studies today; in all, sixty-six poets are represented.

The editors have included complete works wherever feasible?including the complete texts of Tennyson’s In
Memoriam and of a number of other long poems. A headnote by the editors introduces the work of each poet,
and each selection has been newly annotated.

The inclusion of twenty-five selections of the poetic theory from the period is an important feature rounding
out the anthology.

This anthology is also available in a concise edition.
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Cyr:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or data even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe can update
themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you
actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Broadview Anthology of Victorian
Poetry and Poetic Theory (Broadview Anthologies of English Literature) (Anthologies of English Literature
Series) is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you
want and want in this era.

David Beall:

Now a day people that Living in the era just where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to
be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Examining a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this The Broadview Anthology of Victorian
Poetry and Poetic Theory (Broadview Anthologies of English Literature) (Anthologies of English Literature
Series) book as this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred pct
guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Leslie Mickle:

Often the book The Broadview Anthology of Victorian Poetry and Poetic Theory (Broadview Anthologies of
English Literature) (Anthologies of English Literature Series) will bring one to the new experience of
reading a book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to see, this
book very appropriate to you. The book The Broadview Anthology of Victorian Poetry and Poetic Theory
(Broadview Anthologies of English Literature) (Anthologies of English Literature Series) is much
recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can more
readily to read the book.

Scott Rochelle:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for your requirements is The Broadview Anthology of Victorian Poetry and Poetic Theory
(Broadview Anthologies of English Literature) (Anthologies of English Literature Series) this guide consist a
lot of the information from the condition of this world now. That book was represented how can the world
has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The particular



writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That is why this book suitable all of you.
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