
American Standard Version of the Holy Bible
(1901)

Anonymous (Bible)

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://linebook.us/go/read.php?id=B003X283N8
http://linebook.us/go/read.php?id=B003X283N8
http://linebook.us/go/read.php?id=B003X283N8


American Standard Version of the Holy Bible (1901)

Anonymous (Bible)

American Standard Version of the Holy Bible (1901) Anonymous (Bible)
The American Standard Version (ASV) came into being due to the leadership of eminent church historian
Phillip Schaff, who assembled a team comprised of 30 American and British scholars. Work began on the
ASV in 1872 and was completed in 1901. The translation committee was tasked with the mission of
providing readers with an accurate, literal, word-for-word translation of the Holy Scriptures.

The ASV took advantage of two 19th century developments to achieve their goal: improvements in
understanding the grammar and syntax of koine Greek (the language of the New Testament), and a more
complete library of manuscripts than previous Bible translators were able to access. The result of this work
was a translation that retained distinctions made in Greek that are not normally expressed in modern English
language.

For example, second person personal pronouns in modern English usage are normally “you” which provides
no distinction between the singular and plural. Koine Greek unambiguously makes the distinction between a
second person personal singular pronoun and the second person personal plural pronoun. In this instance
committee retained these distinctions by using archaic English (“you” for the singular and “ye” for the
plural).

The word-for-word translation of the ASV was attractive in the scholarly environment, and the ASV was
adopted as the standard version used by many American seminaries. However, since the committee took less
license in translation and retained archaic English usages, the ASV is not as easily readable as other modern
versions. As a result, the ASV has not been as successful among lay Christians as it has been in the scholarly
community.

This edition features an artistic cover, a new promotional introduction, an index of scripture references, links
for scripture references to the appropriate passages, and a hierarchical table of contents which makes it
possible to navigate to any part of the book with a minimum of page turns.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Bingham:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a lot
of information that could give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write
about advantage about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some study before they write with their book. One of them is
this American Standard Version of the Holy Bible (1901).

Karen Wells:

The reserve with title American Standard Version of the Holy Bible (1901) has lot of information that you
can discover it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This book exist new expertise the information
that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to find out
how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you in new era of the the positive effect.
You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Johnnie Colby:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving American Standard Version of the
Holy Bible (1901) that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book.
Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world considerably better
then how they react towards the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky
individual but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as
your good habit, you may pick American Standard Version of the Holy Bible (1901) become your starter.

Susan Albro:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't
work here is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer could be American Standard Version of the Holy Bible (1901) why
because the great cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you. The inside or
content will be fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to
pick up this book.
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