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Explores the impact of the latest breakthroughs in cluster SIMS technology

Cluster secondary ion mass spectrometry (SIMS) is a high spatial resolution imaging mass spectrometry
technique, which can be used to characterize the three-dimensional chemical structure in complex organic
and molecular systems. It works by using a cluster ion source to sputter desorb material from a solid sample
surface. Prior to the advent of the cluster source, SIMS was severely limited in its ability to characterize soft
samples as a result of damage from the atomic source. Molecular samples were essentially destroyed during
analysis, limiting the method's sensitivity and precluding compositional depth profiling. The use of new and
emerging cluster ion beam technologies has all but eliminated these limitations, enabling researchers to enter
into new fields once considered unattainable by the SIMS method.

With contributions from leading mass spectrometry researchers around the world, Cluster Secondary Ion
Mass Spectrometry: Principles and Applications describes the latest breakthroughs in instrumentation, and
addresses best practices in cluster SIMS analysis. It serves as a compendium of knowledge on organic and
polymeric surface and in-depth characterization using cluster ion beams. It covers topics ranging from the
fundamentals and theory of cluster SIMS, to the important chemistries behind the success of the technique,
as well as the wide-ranging applications of the technology. Examples of subjects covered include:

Cluster SIMS theory and modeling●

Cluster ion source types and performance expectations●

Cluster ion beams for surface analysis experiments●

Molecular depth profiling and 3-D analysis with cluster ion beams●

Specialty applications ranging from biological samples analysis to semiconductors/metals analysis●

Future challenges and prospects for cluster SIMS●

This book is intended to benefit any scientist, ranging from beginning to advanced in level, with plenty of
figures to help better understand complex concepts and processes. In addition, each chapter ends with a
detailed reference set to the primary literature, facilitating further research into individual topics where
desired. Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and Applications is a must-have read for any
researcher in the surface analysis and/or imaging mass spectrometry fields.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Lyons:

Here thing why that Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and Applications are different and
trusted to be yours. First of all reading a book is good but it depends in the content from it which is the
content is as scrumptious as food or not. Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and
Applications giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any book out there but there is no
reserve that similar with Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and Applications. It gives you
thrill reading journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing which happened in the world
which is might be can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in recreation area,
café, or even in your way home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the
form of Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and Applications in e-book can be your
alternate.

Daniel Campbell:

Do you considered one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys this particular aren't like that. This Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and
Applications book is readable through you who hate those straight word style. You will find the info here are
arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to
offer to you. The writer regarding Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and Applications
content conveys prospect easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in
the content but it just different as it. So , do you even now thinking Cluster Secondary Ion Mass
Spectrometry: Principles and Applications is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Brian Robinson:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject Cluster Secondary
Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and Applications suitable to you? Typically the book was written by
famous writer in this era. The book untitled Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and
Applicationsis one of several books in which everyone read now. This book was inspired a lot of people in
the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimension that you ever know previous to. The
author explained their plan in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this
book. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. To help you to see the
represented of the world on this book.

Kenneth Rogers:

Beside that Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and Applications in your phone, it could
give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you can
got here is fresh from oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow small



town. It is good thing to have Cluster Secondary Ion Mass Spectrometry: Principles and Applications
because this book offers for you readable information. Do you often have book but you seldom get what it's
interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable set
up here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this
book and also read it from today!
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