
Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography (Popular
Culture Bio-Bibliographies)

Wes D. Gehring

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://linebook.us/go/read.php?id=031325172X
http://linebook.us/go/read.php?id=031325172X
http://linebook.us/go/read.php?id=031325172X


Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-
Bibliographies)

Wes D. Gehring

Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies) Wes D. Gehring

This book presents a combined biographical, critical, and bibliographical estimate of Laurel & Hardy's
significance in film comedy, the arts in general, and as popular culture icons. Of the two, Laurel decidedly
evolves as the central player in this duo biography. The reasons for this are several, but mainly stem from
Laurel's role as team spokesman; his late life accessibility; media coverage given to his private life; and the
fact that he outlived Hardy by eight years--from 1957 to 1965--a period in which the ever burgeoning public
fascination with the team reached new proportions. Hardy's artistic input, however, is currently being given a
revisionist upgrading, which Gehring addresses.

The book is divided into five chapters. Chapter 1 is a biography of Laurel & Hardy, exploring the public and
private sides of their lives. Chapter 2 is a critique of four broad influences of Laurel & Hardy--as special
icons of comic frustrations; as developers of a change in film comedy pacing (which also eased their
transition from silent to sound film); as movie pioneers in the innovative early use of comic sound; and, most
importantly, as key participants in the evolution of the comic antihero into American mainstream humor.
Chapter 3 is composed of two very early reprinted Laurel & Hardy articles and a special Encore collection.
Chapter 4 is a very ambitious Laurel & Hardy bibliographical essay, assessing key reference materials and
locating research collections open to the student and/or scholar. This involves many obscure, often early
and/or untranslated articles drawn from research in Ulverston England--Laurel's birthplace--London and
Paris. Chapter 5 is a bibliographical checklist of all sources recommended in Chapter 4. This volume should
be of special interest to all Laurel & Hardy aficionados, and students/scholars of comedy.
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From reader reviews:

Trisha Sherman:

The book Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies) make you feel enjoy
for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable far more increase. Book can to get your best friend
when you getting tension or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading through a book
Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies) to be your habit, you can get
far more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all
subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open and read a guide Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-
Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or
encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Larry Davis:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on
guys this particular aren't like that. This Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-
Bibliographies) book is readable by simply you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the data
here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want
to deliver to you. The writer regarding Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-
Bibliographies) content conveys prospect easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are
not different in the written content but it just different as it. So , do you even now thinking Laurel and Hardy:
A Bio-Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies) is not loveable to be your top collection reading
book?

Gerald Chisholm:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the subject Laurel and
Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies) suitable to you? The particular book was
written by well-known writer in this era. The actual book untitled Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography
(Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies)is a single of several books that everyone read now. That book was
inspired many people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new age that you ever know
before. The author explained their concept in the simple way, so all of people can easily to be aware of the
core of this guide. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. So that you
can see the represented of the world on this book.

Carlos McNerney:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get lots
of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever try this



one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular book you have read
is Laurel and Hardy: A Bio-Bibliography (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies).
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