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If you love movies, TV, and video games, then you’ve probably thought seriously about investing in a high-
definition television set, otherwise known as HDTV. But before you run to your nearest electronic goods
store, you should know what you’re investing your hard-earned money in, which TV set is good for you, and
other things that will optimize your viewing pleasure.

HDTV for Dummies shows you everything you need to know about buying the right equipment, setting it up,
and enjoying all the things you love about TV. It’ll save you tons of confusion over this exciting new
technology and tell you everything you need to know about terms, concepts, and the difference between HD
and digital. This handy guide gives you the tools you need to:

Get connected with video and audio cables●

Hook up your DVD player, VCR, PC, camcorder, and other fun stuff●

Mount your HDTV●

Receive HDTV programming●

Understand the difference between HD DVD and Blu-ray disc players●

Record with DVRs and VCRs●

Install game consoles like PS3, Xbox 360, and Nintendo Wii●

Enhance your HDTV with audio upgrades●

The guide also shows you how to shop smart and lists the best places to buy your HDTV and popular
accessories to pump up your system. With up-to-date knowledge on the latest technology in the market
today, HDTV for Dummies gives you a clear picture of what HDTV can do for your viewing experience!
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From reader reviews:

Carlo Young:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this HDTV For Dummies reserve written by well-
known writer we are excited for well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who also read
the book. Written inside good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and creating skill only for
eliminate your hunger then you still doubt HDTV For Dummies as good book not simply by the cover but
also from the content. This is one reserve that can break don't assess book by its handle, so do you still
needing a different sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told you
so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Lori Gravitt:

Reading a book to be new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you study a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what
types of book that you have read. In order to get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics,
as well as soon. The HDTV For Dummies provide you with a new experience in looking at a book.

Mathew Holstein:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen have to have book to know the up-date information of year in order to year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can bring us to around the
world. From the book HDTV For Dummies we can acquire more advantage. Don't someone to be creative
people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that ideal with
your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life with this book HDTV For Dummies. You can more
desirable than now.

Judy Williams:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source this filled update of news.
On this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
searching for the HDTV For Dummies when you required it?
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