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DK Eyewitness Travel Guide: London is your in-depth guide to the very best of London. From taking in the
magnificent sight of Big Ben and Parliament Square from the great heights of the London Eye to walking
across Tower Bridge after visiting the historic Tower of London to treating yourself to a night at the theatre
on the city's West , London truly offers a little bit of everything.

Discover DK Eyewitness Travel Guide: London:

   • Detailed itineraries and "don't-miss" destination highlights at a glance.
   • Illustrated cutaway 3-D drawings of important sights.
   • Floor plans and guided visitor information for major museums.
   • Free, color pull-out map (print edition) marked with sights, a selected sight and street index, public transit
map, practical information on getting around, and a distance chart for measuring walking distances .
   • Guided walking tours, local drink and dining specialties to try, things to do, and places to eat, drink, and
shop by area.
   • Area maps marked with sights and restaurants .
   • Detailed city maps include street finder index for easy navigation.
   • Insights into history and culture to help you understand the stories behind the sights.
   • Suggested day-trips and itineraries to explore beyond the city .
   • Hotel and restaurant listings highlight DK Choice special recommendations.

With hundreds of full-color photographs, hand-drawn illustrations, and custom maps that illuminate every
page, DK Eyewitness Travel Guide: London truly shows you this city as no one else can.

Recommend: For a pocket guidebook to London, check out DK Eyewitness Travel Guide: Top 10 London,
which is packed with dozens of top 10 lists, ensuring you make the most of your time and experience the best
of everything.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Gibson:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or details even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This DK Eyewitness
Travel Guide: London is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves
what you want and wish in this era.

Marjorie Batchelder:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you more imaginative.
When you studying a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to some others. When you
read this DK Eyewitness Travel Guide: London, you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon
about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a e-book.

Willie Long:

Typically the book DK Eyewitness Travel Guide: London has a lot associated with on it. So when you make
sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The
writer makes some research previous to write this book. That book very easy to read you may get the point
easily after reading this book.

Patrice Lach:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the top book
for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is known as of book DK Eyewitness
Travel Guide: London. Contain your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it might add your
knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about book. It
can bring you from one spot to other place.
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