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Abraham Lincoln’s sense of humor proved legendary during his own time and remains a celebrated facet of
his personality to this day. Indeed, his love of jokes—hearing them, telling them, drawing morals from
them—prompted critics to dub Lincoln “the National Joker.” The political cartoons and print satires that
mocked Lincoln often trafficked in precisely the same images and terms Lincoln humorously used to
characterize himself. In this intriguing study, Todd Nathan Thompson considers the politically productive
tension between Lincoln’s use of satire and the satiric treatments of him in political cartoons, humor
periodicals, joke books, and campaign literature. By fashioning a folksy, fallible persona, Thompson shows,
Lincoln was able to use satire as a weapon without being severely wounded by it.
 
In his speeches, writings, and public persona, Lincoln combined modesty and attack, engaging in strategic
self-deprecation while denouncing his opponents, their policies, and their arguments, thus refiguring satiric
discourse as political discourse and vice versa. At the same time, he astutely deflected his opponents’
criticisms of him by embracing and sometimes preemptively initiating those criticisms. Thompson traces
Lincoln’s comic sources and explains how, in reapplying others’ jokes and stories to political circumstances,
he transformed humor into satire. Time and time again, Thompson shows, Lincoln engaged in self-mockery,
turning negative assumptions or depictions of him—as ugly, cowardly, jocular, inexperienced—into positive
traits that identified him as an everyman while attacking his opponents’ claims to greatness, heroism, and
experience as aristocratic or demagogic. Thompson also considers how Lincoln took advantage of political
cartoons and other media to help proliferate the particular Lincoln image of the “self-made man”;
underscores exceptions to Lincoln’s ability to mitigate negative, satiric depictions of him; and closely
examines political cartoons from both the 1860 and 1864 elections. Throughout, Thompson’s deft analysis
brings to life Lincoln’s popular humor.
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Hopkins:

The publication untitled The National Joker: Abraham Lincoln and the Politics of Satire is the publication
that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to
an individual. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The author was did a lot of study when write the book, hence the information that they share for
you is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of The National Joker: Abraham Lincoln and the
Politics of Satire from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

William Jimenes:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving The National Joker: Abraham
Lincoln and the Politics of Satire that give your fun preference will be satisfied through reading this book.
Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world better then how they
react to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky individual but for
all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your
good habit, you can pick The National Joker: Abraham Lincoln and the Politics of Satire become your
personal starter.

Frederica Dawkins:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen have to have book to know the change information of year to be able to year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the
world. Through the book The National Joker: Abraham Lincoln and the Politics of Satire we can take more
advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To become creative person must prefer to read a book. Just
choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that
book The National Joker: Abraham Lincoln and the Politics of Satire. You can more pleasing than now.

Michael Vines:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that when they
get a half elements of the book. You can choose often the book The National Joker: Abraham Lincoln and
the Politics of Satire to make your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading skill is developing
when you similar to reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy you just read it and
mingle the opinion about book and looking at especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to wide open
a book and read it. Beside that the publication The National Joker: Abraham Lincoln and the Politics of
Satire can to be a newly purchased friend when you're experience alone and confuse in doing what must
you're doing of this time.
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