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Alexandre Dumas, author of The Three Musketeers, The Count of Monte Cristo, and The Man in the Iron
Mask, is the most famous French writer of the nineteenth century. In 2002, his remains were transferred to
the PanthÃ©on, a mausoleum reserved for the greatest French citizens, amidst much national hype during
his bicentennial. Contemporary France, struggling with the legacies of colonialism and growing diversity,
has transformed Dumas, grandson of a slave from St. Domingue (now Haiti), into a symbol of the colonies
and the larger francophone world in an attempt to integrate its immigrants and migrants from its former
Caribbean, African, and Asian colonies to improve race relations and to promote French globality. Such a
reconception of Dumas has made him a major figure in debates on French identity and colonial history. Ten
tears after Dumas s interment in the PanthÃ©on, the time is ripe to re-evaluate Dumas within this context of
being a representative of la Francophonie. The French re-evaluation of Dumas, therefore, invites a
reassessment of his life, works, legacy, and previous scholarship. This interdisciplinary collection is the first
major work to take up this task. It is unique for being the first scholarly work to bring Dumas into the center
of debates about French identity and France s relations with its former colonies. For the purposes of this
collection, to analyze Dumas in a 'francophone' context means to explore Dumas as a symbol of a 'French'
culture shaped by, and inclusive of, its (former) colonies and current overseas departments. The seven entries
in this collection, which focus on providing new ways of interpreting The Three Musketeers, The Man in the
Iron Mask, The Count of Monte Cristo, and Georges, are categorized into two broad groups. The first group
focuses on Dumas s relationship with the francophone colonial world during his lifetime, which was
characterized by the slave trade, and provides a postcolonial re-examination of his work, which was
impacted profoundly by his status as an individual of black colonial descent in metropolitan France. The
second part of this collection, which is centered broadly around Dumas s francophone legacy, examines the
way he has been remembered in the larger French-speaking (postcolonial) world, which includes
metropolitan France, in the past century to explore questions about French identity in an emerging global
age.
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From reader reviews:

Jose York:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both daily life and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer may unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is definitely The Black Musketeer: Reevaluating Alexandre Dumas within the
Francophone World.

Michelle Bachman:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this The Black Musketeer: Reevaluating
Alexandre Dumas within the Francophone World e-book written by well-known writer whose to say well
how to make book which might be understand by anyone who read the book. Written in good manner for
you, still dripping wet every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still
uncertainty The Black Musketeer: Reevaluating Alexandre Dumas within the Francophone World as good
book not merely by the cover but also through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't assess
book by its deal with, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on
your examining sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Bernice Cofield:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to your account is The Black Musketeer: Reevaluating Alexandre Dumas within the
Francophone World this e-book consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This kind
of book was represented how do the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use for explain it
is easy to understand. The particular writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's why
this book suitable all of you.

Cassandra Rosas:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you
also know that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading
is very important and also book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book. Many



kinds of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is this The Black Musketeer: Reevaluating
Alexandre Dumas within the Francophone World.
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