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Here is the first book in the ‘Tamed’ Series by author Chloe Parks, a seductive contemporary romance filled
with intense passion and sensuality.

Leah and Stacy are identical twins, but they couldn’t have more different lives. Leah is broke and jobless,
while Stacy is a star of the popular soap opera Young, Wild and Rich. But when Stacy suddenly disappears,
Leah must find a way to adapt to her sister’s lifestyle in order to save her job.

Now she finds herself in the spotlight, impersonating her sister in a lead soap-opera role, and trying not to
lose her head over her sexy co-star Matt Delaney and his mind-numbingly magnetic good looks. Matt is
utterly gorgeous—sharp blue eyes, a chiseled face, and a body that makes Leah feel giddy. How will she be
able to keep her head on set when sexy Matt Delaney is around? Romance combined with mistaken identity
proves a recipe for drama, as nothing stays simple in Leah’s new double-life.

Only mature readers should download this book.
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From reader reviews:

Gregory Richards:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by means of
surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a publication your ability to survive increase then having chance to stay than other is high. In
your case who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you that Tamed book as basic and daily
reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Doreen Williams:

The experience that you get from Tamed is the more deep you looking the information that hide inside the
words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but
Tamed giving you thrill feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in specific way that can be
understood by means of anyone who read this because the author of this book is well-known enough. That
book also makes your vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go together with
you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this Tamed
instantly.

Robert Alleman:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book mainly book
entitled Tamed your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe
unfamiliar for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a guide then
become one type conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get prior to. The Tamed giving you an
additional experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful details for your better life
in this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern is your body and mind will probably be pleased
when you are finished reading through it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out
spare time activity?

Clark Abeyta:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make you
to definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can
view that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended for
you is Tamed this book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This kind of
book was represented how can the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer require to explain
it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some exploration when he makes this book. Here is why
this book suited all of you.
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