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Young scientist, Tricia Clarke, is on the verge of a major breakthrough in her career when life throws her a
curve ball - she rediscovers her love for her white step-brother, Malcolm. This sexual tension comes to a
boiling point when Malcolm tries to get her to go on a family reunion on a cruise ship. But this isn't going to
be smooth sailing for Tricia. Not only is her career hanging in the balance, Malcolm is engaged and their
family knows nothing about their illicit romance.

Will this black woman win the heart of her wealthy, white, older in-law?
Will her son and the rest of her family accept this romance?
Will she be able to keep it all together and succeed in her career goals?

This black woman, white man, billionaire romance is bursting at the seams with suspense, action and a touch
of tenderness.
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From reader reviews:

Alma Saunders:

Book will be written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication Cruisin' for Love will make you
to become smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you
think which open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they can be thought
like that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Ida Vanwormer:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming
to a person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Cruisin' for Love is our recommendation
so you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Shawn McDonald:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you already
been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Cruisin' for Love, you are able to enjoy both.
It is great combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its
mind hangout folks. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Betty Bowers:

Some individuals said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the
idea when they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book Cruisin' for Love to make
your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading expertise is developing when you just like reading.
Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the sensation about book and
examining especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open a book and go through it. Beside that the
book Cruisin' for Love can to be your friend when you're experience alone and confuse with the information
must you're doing of these time.
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