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First published in 1797, The Italian is one of the finest examples of Gothic romance. The fast-paced,
narrative centres on Ann Radcliffe's most brilliant creation, the sinister monk Schedoni, whose past is
shrouded in mystery.

From the novel's opening chapters the reader is ushered into a shadowy world in which crime and religion
are mingled. In the church of Santa Maria del Pianto in Naples, Ellena Rosalba and Vincentio di Vivaldi first
meet; but their love is ill-omened. Leagued against them are the proud and ambitious Marchese di Vivaldi
and her confessor Father Schedoni. When Ellena vanishes on the death of her guardian, Vivaldi sets out in
pursuit of her across the mountainous regions of southern Italy before himself falling prey to the Holy
Inquisition.

This revised and expanded edition explores the novel in the context of British attitudes to Italy and Roman
Catholicism in the late eighteenth century with close attention to the novel's style and form.
 About the Series: For over 100 years Oxford World's Classics has made available the broadest spectrum of
literature from around the globe. Each affordable volume reflects Oxford's commitment to scholarship,
providing the most accurate text plus a wealth of other valuable features, including expert introductions by
leading authorities, voluminous notes to clarify the text, up-to-date bibliographies for further study, and
much more.
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From reader reviews:

Kurt Rose:

This The Italian (Oxford World's Classics) are usually reliable for you who want to become a successful
person, why. The explanation of this The Italian (Oxford World's Classics) can be one of several great books
you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you with information that
possibly will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and
whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed types. Beside that this The Italian (Oxford
World's Classics) giving you an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you demo of
critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day task. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Joseph Mack:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its include may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer may be The Italian (Oxford World's Classics) why because the amazing cover
that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is
fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Diane Welton:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
better to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers,
book, and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual book
that recommended to you is The Italian (Oxford World's Classics) this book consist a lot of the information
with the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how can the world has grown up.
The vocabulary styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. That is why this book suited all of you.

Lisa Gregory:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This specific book The Italian (Oxford World's Classics) was vibrant
and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book The Italian (Oxford World's Classics) has many
kinds or style. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and
think you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers
up you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading that.
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