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»Das ist kein Mond – das ist eine Raumstation!« OBI-WAN KENOBI

Modell: Mobile Weltall-Kampfstation

Chefkonstrukteur: Bevel Lemelisk

Entwurf: Großmoff Wilhuff Tarkin

Durchmesser: 120 km

Umfang: 376 km

Besatzung: 27.048 Offiziere, 774.576 Mannschaftsgrade, 378.685 Mann Hilfs- und Wartungspersonal
25.984 Sturmtruppler, 400.000 Droiden

Bewaffnung: 1 Superlaser, 5.000 Turbolaser-Batterien, 5.000 Schwere Turbolaser-Batterien, 2.500
Laserkanonen, 7.000 TIE-Fighter 4 Angriffskreuzer, 20.000 verschiedene Fahrzeuge und Läufer
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From reader reviews:

Amelia Page:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they consider because their hobby will be reading a book. Why not the person who don't
like examining a book? Sometime, individual feel need book once they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Star Wars^ Die Macht des Todessterns (German Edition).

Joseph Franson:

What do you think about book? It is just for students as they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't wish do
that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Star Wars^ Die Macht des Todessterns
(German Edition). All type of book is it possible to see on many sources. You can look for the internet
options or other social media.

Heather Vazquez:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Star Wars^ Die Macht des Todessterns (German
Edition) as your daily resource information.

Alexander Pridmore:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you learn a book
you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon.
The Star Wars^ Die Macht des Todessterns (German Edition) will give you new experience in reading
through a book.
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