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Drawing from legal and extralegal discourse but focusing on imaginative literature, Literary Executions
examines representations of, responses to, and arguments for and against the death penalty in the United
States over the long nineteenth century. John Cyril Barton creates a generative dialogue between artistic
relics and legal history. He looks to novels, short stories, poems, and creative nonfiction as well as legislative
reports, trial transcripts, legal documents, newspaper and journal articles, treatises, and popular books (like
The Record of Crimes, A Defence of Capital Punishment, and The Gallows, the Prison, and the Poor House),
all of which were part of the debate over the death penalty.

Barton focuses on several canonical figures?James Fenimore Cooper, Nathaniel Hawthorne, Lydia Maria
Child, Walt Whitman, Herman Melville, and Theodore Dreiser?and offers new readings of their work in
light of the death penalty controversy. Barton also gives close attention to a host of then-popular-but-now-
forgotten writers?particularly John Neal, Slidell MacKenzie, William Gilmore Simms, Sylvester Judd, and
George Lippard?whose work helped shape or was shaped by the influential anti-gallows movement.

Analyzing the tension between sovereignty and social responsibility in a democratic republic, Barton argues
that the high stakes of capital punishment dramatize the confrontation between the citizen-subject and
sovereign authority in its starkest terms. In bringing together the social and the aesthetic, Barton shows how
legal forms informed literary forms and traces the emergence of the modern State in terms of the
administration of lawful death.

By engaging the politics and poetics of capital punishment, Literary Executions contends that the movement
to abolish the death penalty in the United States should be seen as an important part of the context that
brought about the flowering of the American Renaissance during the antebellum period and that influenced
literature later in the nineteenth and early twentieth centuries.
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From reader reviews:

Terry Kopp:

What do you concerning book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They must answer that question due to
the fact just their can do which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
appropriate. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this specific Literary Executions:
Capital Punishment and American Culture, 1820-1925 to read.

Scott Foust:

Here thing why this particular Literary Executions: Capital Punishment and American Culture, 1820-1925
are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it depends in the content of
it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Literary Executions: Capital Punishment and American
Culture, 1820-1925 giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any reserve out there
but there is no reserve that similar with Literary Executions: Capital Punishment and American Culture,
1820-1925. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your eyes about the thing this happened in the
world which is might be can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in park your car,
café, or even in your method home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the published
book maybe the form of Literary Executions: Capital Punishment and American Culture, 1820-1925 in e-
book can be your option.

Clyde Okane:

This Literary Executions: Capital Punishment and American Culture, 1820-1925 is great reserve for you
because the content that is certainly full of information for you who else always deal with world and also
have to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it details accurately using great plan word or
we can claim no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole data in it.
Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but tricky core information with beautiful
delivering sentences. Having Literary Executions: Capital Punishment and American Culture, 1820-1925 in
your hand like getting the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no reserve that
offer you world in ten or fifteen tiny right but this reserve already do that. So , this really is good reading
book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt this?

Kimberly Duda:

The book untitled Literary Executions: Capital Punishment and American Culture, 1820-1925 contain a lot
of information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy means. The language is very clear to
see all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous



author. The author provides you in the new period of time of literary works. You can actually read this book
because you can read more your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site and order it. Have a nice
learn.
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