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Almost three decades after publication of the tenth volume of A History of the South -- George Tindall's The
Emergence of the New South, 1913--1945 -- Numan V. Bartley now presents Volume XI: a masterly
synthesis of the region's most complex years to date. From the close of World War II to the end of the
seventies, the South underwent changes of such a radical nature and such tumultuous process -- from rural
orientation to urban; from segregated society to racially commingled; from poverty-saturated economy to
positively booming Sunbelt -- that the contrast between 1945 and 1980 almost defies cogent explanation.
Bartley, however, meets that challenge, illuminating the intervening years both individually and collectively
within one monumental work.

In a narrative that exhibits balance, clarity, and objectivity, Bartley traces developments in the political,
economic, religious, cultural, and social realms of southern life. He follows the rise and fall of postwar
liberalism, the role of the Dixiecrats, and the resurgence of southern conservatism. He discusses the
depopulation of the countryside, the growth of urban areas, and the expansion of industry and servicesÐand
how these changes affected the way southerners lived their lives, earned their livelihoods, and interpreted the
world around them.

Here, perhaps for the first time in one volume, is the complete civil rights story. The movements both for
black civil rights and for women's rights, Bartley shows, contributed to and benefited from the spread of
modernist culture in the region. One effect of that culture was the dissolution of restrictive social norms and
the furtherance of an individualism oriented toward self-fulfillment and self-achievement.

In his Afterword, Bartley offers an interpretative overview of events and also identifies trends since 1980.
His Bibliographical Essay is a testimony to his superb command of the material of the period; it could stand
alone as one of the finest available guides to primary and secondary sources on the modern South.

Long awaited, The New South, 1945--1980 is a feat of historical detail and summation that will become the
essential resource on the South's recent past.
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From reader reviews:

Roberto Reyes:

The book The New South, 1945--1980: The Story of the South's Modernization (History of the South) give
you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable far more increase.
Book can to become your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem with the subject. If you
can make reading a book The New South, 1945--1980: The Story of the South's Modernization (History of
the South) to become your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your capable, increase your
knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open up and read a
book The New South, 1945--1980: The Story of the South's Modernization (History of the South). Kinds of
book are a lot of. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about
this publication?

Scottie Kelly:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each information they get. How people have
to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this The New South, 1945--1980: The
Story of the South's Modernization (History of the South) book as this book offers you rich info and
knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Robert McKay:

Publication is one of source of expertise. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen require book to know the change information of year to year. As we know those textbooks have
many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. Through the
book The New South, 1945--1980: The Story of the South's Modernization (History of the South) we can
acquire more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To get creative person must love to read a book.
Merely choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with
this book The New South, 1945--1980: The Story of the South's Modernization (History of the South). You
can more desirable than now.

Ryan Walker:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source that will filled
update of news. In this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for a person.
From media social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book?
Or just in search of the The New South, 1945--1980: The Story of the South's Modernization (History of the



South) when you required it?
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