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The Rhodesian African Rifles overcame profoundly divisive racist and tribal differences among its members
because a transcendent "regimental culture" superseded the disparate cultures of its individual soldiers and
officers. The RAR's culture grew around the traditions of the British regimental system, after which the RAR
was patterned. The soldiers of the RAR, regardless of racial or tribal background, identified themselves first
as soldiers and members of the regiment, before their individual race and tribe. Regimental history and
traditions, as well as shared hardships on deployments and training were mechanisms that forced officers and
soldiers to see past differences. The RAR is remarkable because these bonds stayed true through to the end
of the war, through incredible pressure on black Rhodesians to succumb to the black nationalist groups and
cast off a government that was portrayed to them as oppressive, racist and hateful. Through the end of the
Bush War, 1965-1980, RAR soldiers remained loyal and steadfast to their regiment, and that must be their
legacy. In the end, the values of the government were irrelevant. It was the regiment that drew these men in,
and their loyalty was more to their comrades and their heritage than to any particular government or cause.
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From reader reviews:

William Painter:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people have do
something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yeah, by
reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stay than other is high. In your case who
want to start reading a book, we give you this specific The Rhodesian African Rifles: The Growth and
Adaptation of a Multicultural Regiment through the Rhodesian Bush War, 1965-1980 (Art of War Papers
series) book as starter and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Hilda Dolan:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world
could share their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire all their reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they
write about the knowledge about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how
to teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world
always try to improve their talent in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book.
One of them is this The Rhodesian African Rifles: The Growth and Adaptation of a Multicultural Regiment
through the Rhodesian Bush War, 1965-1980 (Art of War Papers series).

Debra Treat:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the time or they will get wide range
of stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are there
when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do you
ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the
particular book you have read is usually The Rhodesian African Rifles: The Growth and Adaptation of a
Multicultural Regiment through the Rhodesian Bush War, 1965-1980 (Art of War Papers series).

Debra McGregor:

The Rhodesian African Rifles: The Growth and Adaptation of a Multicultural Regiment through the
Rhodesian Bush War, 1965-1980 (Art of War Papers series) can be one of your nice books that are good
idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that could increase
your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The
article writer giving his/her effort to put every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing The Rhodesian



African Rifles: The Growth and Adaptation of a Multicultural Regiment through the Rhodesian Bush War,
1965-1980 (Art of War Papers series) however doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest
as well as based confirm resource data that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information
can certainly drawn you into new stage of crucial thinking.
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