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Politicians and the media are natural enemies, but in recent times, the relationship has exploded into all-out
war. Think about bimbo eruptions, DUI arrests, cocaine parties, National Guard service records, Swift Boat
veterans. Think about two generations of Bush presidents up against Dan Rather. Think about who lost.

Craig Crawford has seen it all up close and personal, and he is disturbed by what he sees. When politicians
turn the public against the media, everyone loses?especially unbiased and courageous news reporting. When
veteran White House correspondent Helen Thomas is banished from her front-row post, as she has been in
the current administration?the American public is denied the chance to consider her pointed questions, even
if they go unanswered. Worse, when traditional reporters and media are displaced, the pundits and alternative
media take over. Rush Limbaugh, The O'Reilly Factor, Comedy Central's Jon Stewart, and the bloggers have
their place in American politics, and the 2004 elections showed the incredible power of the Internet. These
media, however, are a different breed, as Crawford points out?they serve a purpose, but at a cost. They
become "opinion merchants," bartering outrageous assertions for audience appeal with little attention to the
truth. These days, the truth is hard to find. If the press is not believed?or believable?because politicians have
turned the public against it, then the press is not free, but under the thumbs of politicians. Without a free
press, there is no democracy. That, says Crawford, is where we find ourselves today. If you don't like the
news, attack the messenger, and it will go away. Going, going, gone.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Woodruff:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one works to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take Attack the Messenger: How Politicians Turn You
Against the Media (American Political Challenges) as your daily resource information.

Marie Clemmer:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its cover may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer could be Attack the Messenger: How Politicians Turn You Against
the Media (American Political Challenges) why because the amazing cover that make you consider in
regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or even
cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Bruce Smith:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we would like. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This book Attack the Messenger: How Politicians Turn You Against the Media
(American Political Challenges) was filled about science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge
about your scientific research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading the book. If you
know how big benefit from a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like today,
many ways to get book that you just wanted.

Cheri Tow:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got pupils? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person similar to reading or as reading through become their hobby. You should know that
reading is very important in addition to book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by
book. Numerous books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is this Attack the
Messenger: How Politicians Turn You Against the Media (American Political Challenges).
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