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It started in 1965 with albums that quickly developed 'classic' status and, despite the passing of subsequent
decades, have lost none of their enduring charm. Bob Dylan's Highway 61 Revisited and Rubber Soul by the
Beatles did much to ensure that albums would become more important than the hitherto champion of music,
the 45. 50 years later albums continue to maintain a special affection with music lovers across the globe. We
all love them. There may be disagreements regarding what constitutes greatness and that's part of the fun.
That's also the main purpose behind writing this book. The aim, quite simply, is to share a passionate love for
the 'album' in its many guises from vinyl, cassette, CD and through to the recent developments of MP3 and
online streaming. The intention of the pages you are about to read is not to patronise, not to lecture, but to
spotlight and discuss in an unpretentious manner the key classics that have brought a sense of tremendous
satisfaction to me... and, I hope, will do the same for those unfamiliar with the albums mentioned.
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From reader reviews:

Ronnie Hamilton:

The book 500 Great Albums can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just
why must we leave the great thing like a book 500 Great Albums? A few of you have a different opinion
about publication. But one aim that book can give many data for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to
closer using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you
are able to share all of these. Book 500 Great Albums has simple shape however you know: it has great and
large function for you. You can look the enormous world by start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Wesley McFarland:

Often the book 500 Great Albums has a lot associated with on it. So when you read this book you can get a
lot of advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Tom makes some research just before
write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can get the point easily after looking over this book.

Jerald Higgins:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this guide. This 500 Great Albums is simple bringing
you can read it in the park, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not possess much space to bring
typically the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can
save the actual book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys
this book.

Virginia White:

As a college student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the
library or to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
spirit or real their interest. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to
generally there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring in
addition to can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important in
your case. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many
ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this 500 Great Albums can make you really feel more interested to
read.
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