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On December 17, 1903, the Wright brothers took their historic first flight, and by 1909 the brothers were
full-fledged celebrities. In September of that year, Wilbur and Orville finally showed the world, firsthand,
just what they had achieved.
In the United States, Wilbur delighted the crowd with spectacular flying demonstrations in New York City
during the city's Hudson-Fulton Celebration. He flew over the harbor, glided past tall buildings, looped the
Statue of Liberty, and even traveled up the Hudson River to Grant's Tomb. The people of New York were
astonished and thrilled to witness these unbelievable flights. At the same time, Orville held daring public
exhibitions in Germany and set amazing new records. He flew the highest ever, and took the longest flight
with a passenger. The Wright brothers opened doors that no one knew could be opened!
Louise Borden and Trish Marx document the extraordinary lives and achievements of two of our most
celebrated American heroes, Wilbur and Orville Wright, from their humble beginnings to their later success
and riches.
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From reader reviews:

Orlando Hernandez:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of publication you
read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want experience happy read
one using theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual Touching the Sky: The Flying
Adventures of Wilbur and Orville Wright is kind of guide which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Alonzo Stark:

The publication with title Touching the Sky: The Flying Adventures of Wilbur and Orville Wright has a lot
of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This specific book exist
new know-how the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world now. That is
important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within
new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the item
anywhere you want.

Ralph Ainsworth:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Touching the Sky: The Flying Adventures
of Wilbur and Orville Wright can be the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are
consequently out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek
activity. So what these books have than the others?

Alicia Cain:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of news. Within this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
similar to newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
seeking the Touching the Sky: The Flying Adventures of Wilbur and Orville Wright when you needed it?
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