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We all want to discover our hidden talents and make an impact with them. But how? Rasmus Ankersen, an
ex-footballer and performance specialist, quit his job and spent six months living with the world's best
athletes in an attempt to answer this question.

Ankersen presents his surprising conclusions in seven lessons on how anyone—or any business or
team—can defy the misconceptions of high performance, learning to build their own gold mine of real talent.

Rasmus Ankersen is a motivational speaker on talent and performance development and a trusted advisor
for businesses and athletes around the world.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Dunn:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled The Gold Mine Effect: Crack the Secrets of High
Performance. Try to make the book The Gold Mine Effect: Crack the Secrets of High Performance as your
close friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you truly feel alone and beside regarding course
make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you considerably
more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let us make new experience in addition to
knowledge with this book.

Paul Heisler:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book The Gold Mine Effect: Crack the Secrets of High
Performance. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is
important the book The Gold Mine Effect: Crack the Secrets of High Performance. You can add information
and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can learn
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple thing until
wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or perhaps searching by internet
system. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's read.

James Goldman:

This The Gold Mine Effect: Crack the Secrets of High Performance book is not really ordinary book, you
have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is information inside
this reserve incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will
get. That The Gold Mine Effect: Crack the Secrets of High Performance without we recognize teach the one
who examining it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't be worry The Gold Mine Effect: Crack
the Secrets of High Performance can bring when you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves'
become full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even phone. This The Gold Mine Effect:
Crack the Secrets of High Performance having great arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not
feel uninterested in reading.

Lee Long:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you
examine a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what
kinds of book that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us novel, comics, as well as



soon. The The Gold Mine Effect: Crack the Secrets of High Performance offer you a new experience in
looking at a book.
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